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“You’re probably wondering what I’m doing here. I thought this would be easier than writing in a diary that
my mom could infiltrate, the way she had with that little cherry leather one I’d kept during eighth grade
where I had divulged the spring fling kissing and stuff that happened between Zeus and me. That was when
she’d given me the stern virgin talk. I vowed never to disclose information like that again in such a careless
manner. But I do like to write – and this way, blogging on the internet, is much better. No one important will
read it (no offense) and I can do it anywhere, like at work at the travel agency, when there’s no one in the
office. Cyberspace is actually the greatest hiding place of them all, isn’t it?” Dannika Elinopoulous is about
to get married, but before the nuptuals, she thinks it would be prudent to get more experience in the sex
department. Sure, she and her fiancé have all sorts of crazy role-play sex including the toxic making love
kind, but the twenty-three-year-old travel agent wonders how she can insure happiness with her soul mate,
the love of her life, Zeus Zepkos. When she dreams about Madonna, it sparks an idea to parallel relationships
in the pop-star’s life. While Zeus in away on a business trip in Japan, Dannika blogs about her quest for the
holy grail of sex knowledge. She reveals much about her life and the big Greek wedding they’ve planned
while plotting to seduce six different potential partners. 1. The record producer 2. The personal trainer 3. The
lesbian 4. The basketball player 5. The artist 6. The actor Will she make it down the aisle or will her plan
back-fire before she can say I do? Follow Dannika’s madcap adventure as she pursues bliss as a sexual
dynamo down her own version of the yellow brick road.
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From reader reviews:

Woodrow Harker:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Putting the Madge in Danna. All type
of book would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Rosalva Nichols:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Putting the Madge in
Danna suitable to you? The actual book was written by famous writer in this era. The actual book untitled
Putting the Madge in Dannais the one of several books this everyone read now. This specific book was
inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new shape that you
ever know just before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to
understand the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world
now. In order to see the represented of the world within this book.

Lena Garcia:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story as well
as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there
are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this Putting the Madge
in Danna.

Joseph Wilds:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Putting the Madge in Danna guide
written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only
for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Putting the Madge in Danna as good book not just by
the cover but also from the content. This is one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its deal
with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading through sixth
sense already told you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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