
No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research
Assignments in Secondary Classrooms - CCSS

Cindy Nottage, Virginia Morse

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=157652065X
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=157652065X
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=157652065X


No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in
Secondary Classrooms - CCSS

Cindy Nottage, Virginia Morse

No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in Secondary Classrooms - CCSS Cindy
Nottage, Virginia Morse

No More Plagiarism provides a structured research model to encourage secondary students to conduct
sophisticated research without plagiarizing. Aligned with the CCSS College and Career Readiness Standards,
this manual teaches students to understand, explore, and refine research topics while evaluating the validity
and reliability of sources. Students will learn to use the Independent Investigative Method (IIM) to become
ethical researchers and establish lifelong careers. The student workpages include instructions, examples, and
workspace to apply the skills for each of the seven steps of the research process. Also included are
assessment forms for each step, giving students the quality criteria to help them achieve at a high level. This
manual will empower students to learn actively through research while gaining content knowledge across the
curriculum.

This comprehensive teacher's guide includes: notes to the teacher and lesson ideas at each of the seven steps;
CCSS College and Career Readiness Standards; self-directed student workpage and student information
forms including examples of each skill being applied; rubrics with quality criteria for each step; an appendix
with a complete listing of the related CCSS skills often used in research and tested techonology sites; and a
CD with editable workpage, information, and assessment forms.

Grades 6–12
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From reader reviews:

Paul Skeens:

Typically the book No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in Secondary Classrooms -
CCSS has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The
book was compiled by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research ahead of write this
book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after perusing this book.

Edward Baca:

Exactly why? Because this No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in Secondary
Classrooms - CCSS is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it
will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who also write
the book in such amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still
convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to
regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book possess such as help
improving your talent and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I
ended up you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Clara Williams:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to
something by book. Different categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra
No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in Secondary Classrooms - CCSS.

Jerri Jackson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in
search of the No More Plagiarism: Transforming Research Assignments in Secondary Classrooms - CCSS
when you required it?
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