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Since its introduction in 2011, the Universal Verification Methodology (UVM) has achieved its promise of
becoming the dominant platform for semiconductor design verification. Advanced UVM delivers proven
coding guidelines, convenient recipes for common tasks, and cutting-edge techniques to provide a
framework within UVM. Once adopted by an organization, these strategies will create immediate benefits,
and help verification teams develop scalable, high-performance environments and maximize their
productivity. The second edition updates the chained sequencer, re-organizes the content, and has a few
minor corrections. “Written by an experienced UVM practitioner, this book contains lots of great tips on
using UVM effectively and example code that actually works!” ~John Aynsley, Doulos “In ‘Advanced
UVM’, Mr. Hunter, based on his company’s real world experiences, provides excellent resources, a well-
tested reference verification environment, and advanced best practices on how to apply UVM. If you are
ready to move beyond a UVM introduction, this should be the book you add to your library.” ~George
Taglieri, Director Verification Product Solutions, Synopsys, Inc.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Boucher:

The book Advanced UVM can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Advanced UVM? Some of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct.
Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, it is possible to give for
each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Advanced UVM has simple shape however, you know: it
has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by open and read a book. So it is
very wonderful.

Gary Forsyth:

This Advanced UVM book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you have by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get data
which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This specific Advanced UVM without
we realize teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be
worry Advanced UVM can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' come to be full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This Advanced UVM having excellent
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Alexandra Stafford:

Here thing why that Advanced UVM are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book
is good however it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Advanced
UVM giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-
book that similar with Advanced UVM. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your personal eyes
about the thing in which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can bring
everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your means home by train. For anyone who is having
difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Advanced UVM in e-book can be your
alternative.

Jason Buckley:

You can obtain this Advanced UVM by check out the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it can
to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only
through written or printed but also can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era just like
now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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