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Also Available…

Wilkinson & Treas: Fundamentals of Nursing Care, 3rd Edition

Treas & Wilkinson: Basic Nursing

Real Nurses. Real People. Real Skills.

Expert nurses show you exactly how to perform the nursing fundamentals skills and procedures you need to
master. Filmed in an actual clinical setting, each video demonstrates every step in the procedure, while a
narrator explains the what, how, and why.

Watch each video from beginning to end without interruption, or watch individual sections as many times as
you wish until you understand exactly what to do and how to do it. From simple to complex, you’ll build
your confidence skill by skill, procedure by procedure.

 

Choose your preferred video format…

Unlimited Instant Streaming Access

1-Year Instant Streaming Access

DVDs
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From reader reviews:

Jean Parks:

With other case, little people like to read book Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access. You can choose
the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book Davis's
Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by
way of a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you may know that. In
this era, we can open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You need to use it
when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's learn.

William Kirby:

The ability that you get from Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access could be the more deep you
looking the information that hide within the words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to comprehend but Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access giving you excitement
feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by
anyone who read that because the author of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your
current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We highly recommend you for having this Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access
instantly.

Arthur Fabry:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read
is definitely Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access.

Andy McNeil:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. With
the book Davis's Nursing Skills Videos: 4 year access we can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely
be creative people? Being creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this time book Davis's Nursing Skills Videos:
4 year access. You can more pleasing than now.
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