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Architect of 'Operation Flood', the largest dairy development programme in the world, Dr Verghese Kurien
has enabled India to become the largest milk producer in the world. A man with a rare vision, Dr Kurien has
devoted a lifetime to realising his dream - empowering the farmers of India. He has engineered the milk
cooperative movement in India. It was a sheer quirk of fate that landed him in Anand where a small group of
farmers were forming a cooperative, Kaira District Cooperative Milk Producers' Union Limited (better
known as Amul), to sell their milk. Intrigued by the integrity and commitment of their leader Tribhuvandas
Patel, Dr Kurien joined them. Since then there has been no looking back. The 'Anand pattern of cooperatives'
was so successful that, at the request of the Government of India, he set up the National Dairy Development
Board to replicate it across India. He also established the Gujarat Cooperative Milk Marketing Federation to
market its products. In these memoirs, Dr Verghese Kurien, popularly known as the 'father of the white
revolution', recounts, with customary candour, the story of his life and how he shaped the dairy industry.
Profoundly inspiring, these memoirs help us comprehend the magnitude of his contributions and his
multifaceted personality. 'I have often claimed that I have had but one good idea in my life: true development
is the development of women and men. This idea took such a hold of me that I remained in this small, sleepy
town of Anand for over fifty years as an employee of farmers. I was never able to give this up for what many
call "a better life". These years have, without an iota of doubt, been the most rewarding years of my life.
Over the years I have spoken ceaselessly of this idea, hoping to enthuse young women and men to adopt my
passion as theirs. I have been fortunate that there have been many who took up the challenge.'
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From reader reviews:

Nora Carter:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the character types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this I Too Had a Dream, you could tells your family, friends and also soon about yours e-book. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a book.

Claude Gonzalez:

I Too Had a Dream can be one of your nice books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away
because this book has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to set every
word into joy arrangement in writing I Too Had a Dream yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be considered one of it.
This great information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

Kenton Marshall:

It is possible to spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This I Too Had a Dream is simple to
deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not get much space to bring
the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the book in your
smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Bryant Booher:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world.
Through the book I Too Had a Dream we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To
become creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your
aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book I Too Had a Dream. You can more desirable than
now.
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