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This revised and updated fourth edition designed for upper division courses in linear algebra includes the
basic results on vector spaces over fields, determinants, the theory of a single linear transformation, and inner
product spaces. While it does not presuppose an earlier course, many connections between linear algebra and
calculus are worked into the discussion. A special feature is the inclusion of sections devoted to applications
of linear algebra, which can either be part of a course, or used for independent study, and new to this edition
is a section on analytic methods in matrix theory, with applications to Markov chains in probability theory.
Proofs of all the main theorems are included, and are presented on an equal footing with methods for solving
numerical problems. Worked examples are integrated into almost every section, to bring out the meaning of
the theorems, and illustrate techniques for solving problems. Many numerical exercises make use of all the
ideas, and develop computational skills, while exercises of a theoretical nature provide opportunities for
students to discover for themselves.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Berube:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Linear Algebra: An
Introductory Approach (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportunity for
people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that
reading routine only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to become success person.
So , for every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick Linear Algebra: An
Introductory Approach (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) become your own personal starter.

James Brown:

This Linear Algebra: An Introductory Approach (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) is great e-book for
you because the content that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to
make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we
can point out no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it.
Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful
delivering sentences. Having Linear Algebra: An Introductory Approach (Undergraduate Texts in
Mathematics) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one particular. We
can say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So ,
this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?

Joan Toon:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since book has a
lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have read.
If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Linear Algebra: An Introductory Approach (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) provide you with a new
experience in reading a book.

Rosa Milliken:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Linear Algebra: An Introductory
Approach (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach,
train as well as soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-
book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot
of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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