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Since the publication of Roy Bhaskar’s A Realist Theory of Science in 1975, critical realism has been
evolved as one of the new developments in the areas of philosophy of natural and social science which offers
an alternatively fresh view to the existing theories including positivism and post-modernism. Bhaskar’s
intellectual movement, which is now fully international and multi-disciplinary, and continues to influence the
philosophies of natural and social science, has transformed into ‘Dialectical Critical Realism’ (hereafter
DCR) and the philosophy of ‘meta-Reality.’

MinGyu will conclude that his anti-anthropic Non-duality continues through all the steps of Bhaskar’s
thought, maintaining the consistency of his scientific, metaphysical, and spiritual journey. The anti-anthropic
motif is fully realized in the philosophy of Non-duality - the ‘constellational identification of dualism,
duality and non-duality’ in his meta-Reality. Defending Bhaskar against Collier, Agar, and Morgan, MinGyu
tries to show how its anti-anthropic and non-dualistic foundation is sustained through the whole of Bhaskar’s
journey, involving a transformation of its subject matters from reality, to the dialectic of reality, to the real
truth underlying the former stages.

This book provides an indispensible resource for all students of philosophy and the human sciences.
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From reader reviews:

James Collis:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Reality and Self-
Realization: Bhaskar's Metaphilosophical Journey toward Non-dual Emancipation (Ontological
Explorations). All type of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions
or other social media.

Annie Hendricks:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication
that need more time to be read. Reality and Self-Realization: Bhaskar's Metaphilosophical Journey toward
Non-dual Emancipation (Ontological Explorations) can be your answer given it can be read by you who have
those short time problems.

James Longo:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Reality and Self-Realization:
Bhaskar's Metaphilosophical Journey toward Non-dual Emancipation (Ontological Explorations) which is
getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.

Annie Fowler:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make summary
for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul or real their leisure activity.
They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and also can't see colorful pictures
on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this age,
many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Reality and Self-Realization: Bhaskar's Metaphilosophical Journey toward Non-dual
Emancipation (Ontological Explorations) can make you sense more interested to read.
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